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CFB Esquimalt - Victoria, BC
1st Annual Silent Auction/Auction Event
Auction Value: $7,907.00
Saturday - 27 Aug 11
Dated: 6 August 2011
Item #1
> Gift Certificate for one Free Haircut
> Len Fraser Barber/Stylist - Esquimalt, BC
> Value: $10.00
> No Bid to date

Item #2 (http://www.paradisefunpark.net/)

Gift Certificate for a family (two adults and two children)
Paradise Adventure Mini Golf - Parksville, BC

18 holes of Mini-Putt Golf and Bumper Boats

Value: $50.00

No Bid to date
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Item #3 (http://www.paradisefunpark.net/)

Gift Certificate for a family (two adults and two children)
Paradise Adventure Mini Golf - Parksville, BC

18 holes of Mini-Putt Golf and Bumper Boats

Value: $50.00

No Bid to date
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Item #4 (http://www.ocean-trails.com/index.html)

> Gift Certificate for 2 Nights Accommodations - 1 Bedroom Condo
> Ocean Trails Resort - Parksville, BC

> Value: $275.00

> $100.00 bid made (Lamont French)

Item #5 (http://www.ocean-trails.com/index.html)

Gift Certificate for 2 Nights Accommodations - 2 Bedroom Condo
Ocean Trails Resort - Parksville, BC

Value: $320.00

No Bid to date
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Item #6 (http://www.tsf-bcaa.com/)

Gift Certificate for 1 Year Basic Membership to BCAA
BCAA Millstream Office - Victoria, BC

Value: $98.00

No Bid to date
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Item #7 (http://www.geo.ca/)

$50 Gift Certificate for Uniglobe

2 Mancini Leather Passport Covers
Uniglobe Geo Travel - CFB Esquimalt Office
Value: $150.00

No Bid to date
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Item #8 (http://www.tigh-na-mara.com/)
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» Two "Grotto Spa Day Passes"
> Tigh-Na-Mara Seaside Spa Resort - Parksville, BC
> Value: $80.00
> $25.00 bid made (Lamont French)

Item #9 (http://www.action-motorcycles.com/)

> Two $25 ($50) Gift Cards for Action Motorcycles
» Action Motorcycles - Victoria, BC

> $50.00

> No Bid to date

Item #10 (http://www.innonlonglake.com/)

Two, one night accommodations at the Inn on Long Lake
Inn on Long Lake, Nanaimo, BC

Value: $ 250.00

No Bid to date
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Item #11 (http://www.greatcanadianoilchange.com/bc.htm)

Five , $20 Gift certificates - Langford Location
Great Canadian Oil Change - Langford, BC
Value: $ 100.00

No Bid to date
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Item #12 (http://www.curves.com/)

» Two - 1 month membership to Curves, Langford, BC
» Curves, Langford, BC
» Value: $ 200.00
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> No Bid to date

Item #13 (http://www.barneshd.com/)

» 2010 Harley Davidson Military Archive Collection Shadow Box
> Barnes Harley Davidson - Langley, BC

» Value: $ 300.00

» No Bid to date

Item #14
(http://2700governmentstreet.midasvancouver.com/store.aspxPshopNum=9991)

$50 Gift Certificate for Service at Midas Auto Service
Midas - 2700 Government St, Victoria, BC

Value: $ 50.00

No Bid to date
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Item #15 (http://www.petsmart.com/)

Gift basket for the Dog lover in your family
Pet-Smart, 2401 Millstream Rd, Victoria, BC
Value: $ 50.00
No Bid to date
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Item #16 (http://www.deltahotels.com/en/hotels/british-columbia/delta-victoria-

ocean-pointe-resort/)

One Nights Stay at the Delta Victoria

Delta Victoria Ocean Pointe Resort and Spa - Victoria, BC
Value: $ 200.00

No Bid to date
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Item #17 (http://glovictoria.com/)

$25 Gift Certificate to the Glo Restaurant/Lounge
Glo Restaurant/Lounge or Med Grill - Victoria, BC
Value: $ 25.00
No Bid to date
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Item #18 (http://www.savagecycles.ca/)

Two x $25 Gift Certificate for Savage Cycles
C&S Motorcycles Ltd/Savagecycles - Victoria, BC
Value: $ 50.00

No Bid to date
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Item #19 (http://mmbc.bc.ca/)

One x Family Pass to the Maritime Museum of BC
Maritime Museum of BC - Victoria, BC

Value: $ 30.00

No Bid to date
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Item #20 (http://www.rovalbcmuseum.bc.ca/MainSite/default.aspx)

Two x Adult Passes for the Royal BC Museum
Royal BC Museum - Victoria, BC

Value: $ 32.00

No Bid to date
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Item #21 (http://www.webvictoria.com/caprice/index.html)

» Two x Two Adult Passes for the Caprice Showcase Theatres
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> Caprice Showcase Theatre - Langford/Victoria, BC
> Value: $ 24.00

>

No Bid to date

Item #22 (http://www.golfprospect.com/)

YV VYV

Two x 9 Hole Golf Passes, with a $10.00 Restaurant Gift Card
Prospect Lake Golf Course - Victoria, BC

Value: $ 60.00

No Bid to date

Item #23 (http://www.londondrugs.com/)

YV V VYV

Two x $25 Gift Certificates

London Drugs - Store #046 Colwood Corners - Victoria, BC
Value: $ 50.00

No Bid to date

Item #24 (http://www.princeofwhales.com/)

YV V VYV

Gift Cert for two adults on the Ocean Magic Express Cruiser
Prince of Whales Whale Watching - Victoria, BC

Value: $ 250.00

No Bid to date

Item #25

>
>

Home made White/Off White Maritime Cable style sweater
Donated by Mrs Trixie French - Lewisporte, NL

» Value: $ 150.00
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> No Bid to date

Item #26

2002 Canada Ladies Gold medal Champs framed photo
Autographed by Jayna Hefford

Donated by Lamont French - Victoria, BC

Value: $ 100.00

No Bid to date
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Item #27

Black Overnight Bag, Chev Ball hat and Bud T-Shirt
Donated by Lamont French - Victoria, BC

Value: $ 35.00

No Bid to date
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Item #28

Volvo Ball Hat with BMW Leather Pass Port Cover
Donated by Lamont French - Victoria, BC

Value: $ 50.00

No Bid to date
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Item #29

Team Canada Hockey helmet Toque and “Mini™™ Wallet
Donated by Lamont French - Victoria, BC

Value: $ 50.00

No Bid to date

YV V V
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Item #30

Canadian Forces National Sports Golf Shirt with National Sports Watch
Donated by Lamont French - Victoria, BC
Value: $ 75.00

>
>
>
> No Bid to date

Item #31

CBC Hockey Night in Canada, Play On Ball Hat and Toque
Donated by Lamont French - Victoria, BC

Value: $ 35.00

No Bid to date

YV VYV

Item #32

Vancouver Island Brewery Gift Pack
Vancouver Island Brewery - Victoria, BC
Value: $ 25.00

No Bid to date

YV V VYV

Item #33

CBC Hockey Night in Canada, Play On Winter Jacket, Ball Hat and Toque
Donated by Lamont French - Victoria, BC

Value: $ 125.00

No Bid to date

YV VYV

Item #34
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» Stuffed mascot Black Bear, with 2009 and 2010 Ride pins
> Donated by MPNMRR - Victoria, BC
> Value: $ 25.00
> No Bid to date
Item #35
> Stuffed mascot Black Bear, with 2009 and 2010 Ride pins
> Donated by MPNMRR - Victoria, BC
> Value: $ 25.00
> No Bid to date

Item #36

YV V VYV

Stuffed mascot Black Bear, with 2009 and 2010 Ride pins
Donated by MPNMRR - Victoria, BC

Value: $ 25.00

No Bid to date

Item #37

YV V VYV

Stuffed mascot Black Bear, with 2009 and 2010 Ride pins
Donated by MPNMRR - Victoria, BC

Value: $ 25.00

No Bid to date

Item #38 (http://www.islandbmw-motorcycles.ca/)

>
>

Gerbings Heated M/C Plants, Size L
Donated by Island BMW, Victoria, BC
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> Value: $ 300.00
> No Bid to date

Item #39 (http://www.milestonesrestaurants.com/)

Gift Cert for Milestones Grill + Bar

Donated by Milestones, Millstream, Victoria, BC
Value: $ 50.00

No Bid to date

YV VYV

Item #40 (http://www.sgpower.com/)

Gift Cert SG Power

Donated by SG Power, Victoria, BC
Value: $ 50.00

No Bid to date

YV V VYV

Item #41 (http://www.sgpower.com/)

Ladies SHR Motorcycle Jacket, Size XL
Donated by SG Power, Victoria, BC
Value: $ 200.00

No Bid to date

YV V VYV

Item #42 (http://www.hyak.com/)

» Gift Cert for one person rafting adventure

10
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> Donated by Hyak River Rafting, Burnaby, BC
> Value: $ 125.00
> No Bid to date

Item #43 (http://www.clippervacations.com/)

Cert for two, roundtrip from Seattle to Victoria
Donated by Clipper vacations, Seattle, WA
Value: $ 300.00

No Bid to date

YV VYV

Item #44 (http://www.digitalcommunications.ca/stores/vancouver-island/)

Nokia 5800 XpressMusic with free GPS Cell Phone

Donated by Digital Communications, Millstream Village, Victoria, BC
Value: $ 525.00

No Bid to date

VV VYV

Item #45 (http://www.cphotelseattle.com/)

Gift Certificate for 1 night in Seattle at the Crowne Plaza
Donated by Crowne plaza, Seattle, WA

Value: $ 170.00

No Bid to date

YV V.V YV

Item #46 (http://www.cabinswest.ca/)

Gift Certificate for two nights accommodation in Ucluelet, BC
Donated by Cabin's West, Ucluelet, BC
Value: $ 285.00

>
>
>
> No Bid to date
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Item #47 (http://www.sidneypier.com/)
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Gift Cert, two nights accommodation and $100 Restaurant Coupon
Donated by The Sidney Pier Hotel & Spa, Sidney, BC

Value: $ 500.00

No Bid to date

Item #48 (http://www.wildplay.com/)

YV V VYV

Gift Cert, two person Bungy Jump Coupons
Donated by Wild play Element Parks, Nanaimo, BC
Value: $ 200.00

No Bid to date

Item #49 (http://www.capbridge.com/index.php)

YV VV YV

4 Guest Day Passes for Capilano Suspension Bridge

Donated by Capilano Suspension Bridge park, North Vancouver, BC
Value: $ 132.00

No Bid to date

Item #50 (http://www.runningroom.com/hm/)

YV V VY

Ladies complete running package (exchangeable for size/gender)
Donated by Running Room Canada Inc, Edmonton, AB

Value: $ 525.00

No Bid to date

Item #51 (http://www.runningroom.com/hm/)
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» Running Waterbottle belt and two runners T-Shirts
> Donated by Running Room Canada Inc, Edmonton, AB
> Value: $ 80.00
> No Bid to date

Item #52 (http://martysmountaincycle.com/)

YV V VYV

Sigma Sport PC9 Heart Rate Pulse Computer
Donated by Marty's Mountain Cycle, Victoria, BC
Value: $ 100.00

No Bid to date

Item #53 (http://www.everythingwine.ca/)

YV V VYV

Private Wine Tasting for 10 persons at Everything Wine
Donated by Everything Wine, Millstream Rd, Victoria, BC
Value: $ 400.00

No Bid to date

Item #54 (http://www.interiorwhitewater.bc.ca/)

YV V VYV

One person - One day "Guaranteed Addiction” Whitewater Adventure
Donated by Interior Whitewater Expeditions Ltd, Clearwater, BC
Value: $ 159.00

No Bid to date

Item #55 (http://www.interiorwhitewater.bc.ca/)

>
>

One person - 3 hr, "Ready-Set-Go"” Whitewater Adventure
Donated by Interior Whitewater Expeditions Ltd, Clearwater, BC

13
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> Value: $ 99.00
> No Bid to date

Item #56 (http://www.interiorwhitewater.bc.ca/)

Value: $ 99.00
No Bid to date

YV VYV

One person - 3 hr, "Catch a Wave" Whitewater Adventure
Donated by Interior Whitewater Expeditions Ltd, Clearwater, BC

Item #57 (http://www.chemainustheatrefestival.ca/)

YV VV YV

No Bid to date

2 Person admission for "Country Christmas Play”, 11-25 Nov 11
Donated by Chemainus Theatre Festival, Chemainus, BC
Value: $ 108.00

To make either advance or sealed bids, please send the bids to myself directly and I be happy to

add it to this form, so we can generate interest and bids in advance.

Sincerely;

14
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Lamont French

National Co-Chair and BC Chair

3rd Annual Military Police National Motorcycle Relay Ride
(MPNMRR)

email: lamontfrench@shaw.ca
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